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ABSTRACT  
 

Today many conflicts arise that lead to destructive conditions concerning industrial relations, including conflict between the 
workers as a key element of the production and the entrepreneur as the owner of capital. Many workers demands against their 
rights to entrepreneurs who cannot be packed in containers appropriate mediation so that not infrequently lead to greater 
conflict. Frame of mind in this study based on the fact that the management of conflicts in industrial relations requires the 
involvement of all stakeholders in the organization. Support regulations and policies are also strongly demanded that the conflict 
can be managed properly in order to achieve a favorable climate objective so that employees can work optimally in order to 
achieve organizational goals through the organization’s culture. Organizational culture is very important role in supporting the 
creation of an effective organization. There are certain characteristics as forming an organizational culture that is used in this 
research is focused on the culture of quality. This study aims to map the factors related to conflict management in particular 
industrial worker organization’s involvement in shaping the culture of the organization in conflict management. This study uses 
a qualitative research design with a case study approach where the analysis of this research is done inductively. The design of 
this study refers to the model cycle of Kemmis and M. Taggart (1998) with four stages, namely: 1) preparation, 2) the 
implementation phase, 3) the stage of monitoring, and 4) the stage of reflection. The role of labor union organizations to be very 
important in determining management policies. The union becomes a container in delivering the aspirations of employees that 
are part contribution to the company’s employees. Union organization is able to manage conflict are expected to be part of the 
motor of the company’s progress. Proven in some respects in accordance with the results of the research, the union was able to 
resolve conflicts without weakening partly conflicting parties. In running the organization, cultivate union members to work 
together and form solidarity among its members. Behaviors and habits that is expected to shape the culture of the organization 
mature and become a strong foundation for the progress of the company. 
 
Keywords: labor union, organization culture, conflict, performance 
 

 
 
 
Introduction  
 
 
The current global economic growth forced the company to remain standing in the midst of increasingly fierce competition. The 
economic theory of competition in general start from the perspective that the market competition is the main instrument 
achievement both in terms of business efficiency, priductive efficiency, or dynamic efficiency. Organizational necessity in the 
face of global competition must be addressed properly because it will impact the corporate culture that led to the organization’s 
performance. There are many ways companies in order to stay alive in running the business, such as by pass a merger or business 
combination, an Initial Public Offering (IPO), improve performance and others with the goal of growth and development of the 
organization could be faster. 
 
Through various efforts in order to survive, but the result was not as expected because many companies forget about the internal 
factors, the actual core of the problem. Expressed in various studies, existing data from companies fail to maintain their business 
more due to cultural conflicts. The average company pays little attention to cultural factors such as the core values of the 
organization. 
 
Culture is the thing that always accompany human life. Culture is always there anytime and anywhere humans are. No exception 
to the life of the organization. In an organization, the essence of life itself an organization is found in the culture. Culture is in a 
different organization with a culture in our daily view. Culture in the organization is not interpreted as racial, ethnic background 
of the individual. According Trujilo Pacanowsky and O’Donnell (1991), the culture in the organization is defined as a way of life 
in the organization, such as climate or atmosphere of emotional and psychological, which include employee morale, attitude and 
productivity levels, as well as symbols. The values of the organization that also influences the formation of organizational culture 
acts as a source of power which is believed important and widely held in facing the challenges of a changing environment. 
 
The progress of industrialization impact on how much manpower requirements, with the increased use of labor, the more causes 
problems and friction that eventually cause unrest within an organization. In the social interaction and interrelation between 
individuals or between groups unavoidable conflict. There are differences in the organization often results in a mismatch that 
ultimately lead to conflict. Conflict is basically due to the interaction called communication. This means, for managing conflict is 
necessary to first determine the ability and communication behavior. All communication containing the conflict, but not all 
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conflicts are rooted in poor communication. Myers (1982: 234) states, if the communication is a transaction process that seeks to 
bring together the individual differences together to seek common meaning, then in the process there must be conflict. 
 
Conflict is a natural phenomenon, in which the consequences that arise can be positive or negative and can be a serious problem 
regardless of the form and level of complexity of the organization. If the conflict leads to destructive conditions that can impact 
on the effectiveness of the organizational form of rejection, resistance to change, apathetic, indifferent, perhaps even destructive 
emotions arise in the form of a demonstration. Because of this, the expertise to manage conflict indispensable for any 
organization. 
 
Today many conflicts arise that lead to destructive conditions concerning industrial relations, including conflict between the 
workers as a key element of the production and the entrepreneur as the owner of capital. Many workers demands against their 
rights to entrepreneurs who can not be packed in containers appropriate mediation so that not infrequently lead to greater 
conflict. Although the Constitution of 1945 already firmly set the guarantees protection of human rights in the political, 
economic, social, and cultural, not infrequently the struggle of the workers or workers fail. 
 
Freedom of association as a fundamental right can not be separated from reality approach to social and political life with its 
different aspects like economic, educational, religious and so on. The reason is aspects of the role is exactly what makes humans 
lose many opportunities to obtain her freedom. Cultural association and establish a good communication system is what will 
expected to make the organization more effective in achieving its objectives. 
 
Indonesia in particular poured freedom of association in the Amendment of UUD 1945 Article 28 E Paragraph (3) which states 
that everyone has the right to freedom of association, assembly, opinion and expression, workers from forming a container which 
is expected to be a means to promote the interests of workers or workers in creating harmonious industrial relations, dynamic and 
equitable. From the description can be interpreted every worker in an organization or company is free to exercise his right to join 
a union and the right to protection of the law. Organization or company in this case is not limited to specific companies, either 
privately owned by the government all have the right of association in accordance the applicable legislation so as with Jasa Tirta 
I were in this study the object being studied. 
 
The dynamics of communication that occurs as a result of the execution of rights and obligations in industrial relations in Jasa 
Tirta I also can not be avoided. Various ways taken by the workers and employers in minimizing the potential for conflict as a 
result of the application of industrial relations. On January 2, 2002 Jasa Tirta I founded the Association of Employees of Jasa 
Tirta I (Ikajati) which is an organization employees of Jasa Tirta I, then Ikajati declared itself a unions are subject to the Law No. 
21 of 2000 on Labor Unions is an organization of representation of workers, representing, acting for and on behalf of the workers 
in terms of negotiating the implementation of rights obligations between workers and employers, being a party to the negotiation 
and signing of the Collective Labour Agreement (PKB) in Jasa Tirta I. 
 
Further through deep observation of phenomena that arise in organizational behavior at the object of research will hopefully find 
a clear proportion of participation labor unions in an enterprise to handling conflicts. The results of these observations will be 
tied to how the company’s performance by focus on the role of the union in addressing the industrial conflict that occurred. In an 
earlier study said there are many reasons why employees Thailand joins the union, including compensation, protection, and 
organizational learning (Suchada Chanprateep, 2011). This indicates the importance of the role of labor unions to take part in any 
industrial conflict in an organization. The author hopes that this research could give a clear answer and thorough will be 
problems that arise related to the conflict, labor, management, organizational culture and corporate performance.  
 
Research focus 
Based on the background briefing that has been described above it appears that the ability and expertise of proper conflict 
management plays an important role in achieving an organization’s effectiveness. In various studies that have been carried out, 
the fit between cultures grown in each individual with a growing culture within an organization (person-culture fit) with positive 
implications, where employee turnover rates can be minimized. The higher the suitability only between individuals and 
organizations allow employees to remain within the organization (Bass & Avolio, 1993; Vestal, 1997). 
 
One effort that can be done to realize the conformity and harmony between the individual and the organization is to disseminate 
organizational culture in order to minimize conflict by fostering better communication between the two. Building a culture of 
organizations by providing freedom of the Constitution of the Republic of Indonesia (UUD 1945) as a means of learning to 
adjust cultures grown in each individual organization’s culture. 
 
The struggle of workers in Indonesia during wants workers to have bargaining power between the employers and the 
Government in the conduct of industrial relations (three partiet), so cooperation three partiet organized into a solution equitable 
application of industrial relations in Indonesia. In order to create harmony and a culture of good organization in order to achieve 
company goals and employee benefits, employees formed a union that is expected to be a means intensive communication in 
conflict management that often arise in the social life of an organization including a conflict that may arise in Jasa Tirta I. 
Employees as one of the main elements of the production and services provided by Jasa Tirta I, as supreme leader of Directors as 
executive management Jasa Tirta I, as the owners of capital and government policy makers and supervision of labor legislation 
which three are forming elements of industrial relations. 
 
The main objective of this study is a qualitative research is to understand the phenomenon or a social phenomenon in Jasa Tirta I 
with more emphasis on a complete picture of the proportion Ikajati as a labor union organization, assessed as variables that affect 
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the conflict within the company itself. The hope is acquired a deep understanding of the phenomena that occur for further 
produced a theory that led to how the labor union organizations that play a role in shaping the culture of the organization to 
optimize the management of conflict for the sake of harmony in organizational life in order to achieve organizational goals and 
effectiveness of the organization in this case linked to the performance of the company. 
 
Organizational Culture in Context Theory 
Organizational culture in the public mind frame members of the organization, which this framework provides basic assumptions 
and values. Basic assumptions and values taught to new members as a way to perceive, think, feel, behave, and expect others to 
behave in the organization. Edgar Schein (1999) says that the culture of the organization developed over time as people in the 
organization learn to deal successfully with problems of external adaptation and internal integration. It’s been discussed and the 
general background. Thus, culture emerges from what has been the result for the organization. 
 
Organizational culture does not present itself among the inter-organization, but it needs to be formed and studied because 
basically the corporate culture is a set of values and behavior patterns are learned, shared by all members of the organization and 
passed on from one generation to the next. Organizational culture is very important role in supporting the creation of an 
organization or company effective. More specifically, the corporate culture can play a role in creating the identity, developing a 
personal involvement with the company and present a code of conduct for employees. On the other hand, the organization must 
have values that are believed to be, upheld, and drives the entire organization to achieve organizational goals, making these 
values into the organization’s culture. There are certain characteristics as forming an organizational culture that is used in this 
research is focused on the culture of quality. 
 
Organizations and Conflict in Perspective Rational 
Humans have explored organizational change for over a thousand years. At the beginning of history, Adam Smith’s research 
focuses on how to organize people to maximize productivity and efficiency. Other early pioneers like Frederick Taylor, Mary 
Parker Follett, Henry Fayol and L.Urwick using time-motion study to organize and maximize human performance from bottom 
to top (bottom-up), that is, to minimize motion in research into the image of Taylor turnover rate workers and maximize the 
output of individuals in the lowest level of the organization. Taylor (1911), Fayol (1916: 1949), Urwick (1937), and Mooney and 
Reiley all the supporters managerial functions (planning, organizing, command, coordination and control) as a closed system 
(Davis & Scott, 2003; Rahim, 1992), In addition, they collectively determine the top-down control that mechanistic with clear 
lines of authority and hierarchical structures that require division of labor, would theoretically encourage harmony and prevent 
conflict. 
 
Mary Parker Follett (1926), touted as the leading edge of the decades other researchers, are also considered as organizational 
researchers classical theory, but Follett added two significant perspective to the theory during 1920. First, believe in an 
organization, constructive conflict added into the value of the organization, an opinion not shared by other fellow theorists who 
believe the conflict should be minimized. Second, Follett believed that repression, avoidance, domination and compromises are 
not effective in dealing with conflicts and instead strongly advocated for integrative problem solving methods by those in charge 
of managerial (Rahim, 1992). 
 
The theory of modern organizations began to focus on the lack of humanity in the organization. Concentration on the humanistic 
aspects of the organization to attract more social scientists. Furthermore, the theory of human relations began to grow and gain 
the support of the theory as Lewin (1948), Likert (1967) and Whyte (1951). Literary (1966), Whyte (1967) and others added to 
the model despite a clearer understanding of the tensions and solving problems. Specifically Whyte (1967) states: 
“The goal should not be to build a harmonious organization, but to build an organization that is able to recognize the problems it 
faces and to develop ways of solving problems. Because the conflict is an inevitable part of organizational life”. 
 
Backed by a statement Nightingale (1974), “The conflict becomes a tool of social change and the effect on the symptoms of the 
disorder in the social relations” (p.175; Rahim, 1992, p 9). Several theories have considered organizational conflict as the 
antithesis of the organization and has started to stress the function of the conflict as an important seeds in organizational 
processes, such as activation and motivation, feedback and control, the balance of power and the formation of the coalition, 
growth and innovation, and bahkanl embaga institutions to channel and resolve disputes. These functions and dysfunctions 
revealed the centrality of the conflict in the life of the organization and complexity associated with the management. Secondly it 
is really important that managers and designers organizations understand the context in which the conflict occurred organizations 
and the various techniques available for use in the management, Miles (1980). 
 
Industry Power and Labor Issues 
Industry or company is a combination of capital, management and workers. They are a separate entity and has a different 
motivation. Investors are investing their primary concern is to get the maximum benefit. Management always be there to protect 
the interests of investors. In the process, workers have always been victims of their exploitation. As a partner of industry, 
workers want justice and get the return rights as a result of implementing the industry. 
 
Of course, workers have the power to eliminate problems such as low wages, poor conditions of health, safety and so on. But 
individual workers are not able to fight on their rights against great combination between investors and management where they 
have the power, money and influence. Workers should know and understand that as individuals and employees will not be much 
they can achieve. Only through the efforts to organize themselves and their collective activities can effectively uphold their 
dignity as individuals and workers. 
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Organization of Labor Unions 
Indonesia is legally had ratified ILO Convention No. 87/1948 which could be a reference to the legal basis for protection of the 
right to organize and the right of association. In the era of Abdurahman Wahid President, issued UU No. 21 of 2000 concerning 
labor unions that provide space and protection on every workers to establish and join a labor union. ILO Convention No. 98/1949 
on the right to organize and the right to collective bargaining has also been ratified, this convention provides broader protection 
role and rights of labor unions on behalf of workers to conduct negotiations with the management for the repair and improvement 
of the terms and conditions of employment. 
 
In the space of freedom of association and assembly is guaranteed by the Constitution of the Republic of Indonesia. Article 28 
UUD 1945 stated: “Freedom of association and assembly, issued thoughts with oral and written, and so on are set by UU”. 
 
Basic article in the constitution that are then complete the formal reference promulgation of UU No. 21 of 2000 on labour 
unions. Subsequent developments in the politics of employment law, workers / labor union is given a considerable role although 
it still remains to be improved. Construction organization of workers or laborers created tiered (hierarchical) as follows: 
 

Figure 1. The Hirarchy of Institusional Organization of Labors 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
The hierarchy of institutional organization of workers or laborers are created to improve the bargaining position of laborers in 
industrial relations. Workers or laborers are working partners of employers is crucial in the production process in order to 
improve the welfare of laborers and their families, ensure the continuity of the company, and improve the welfare of Indonesia 
people in general. Labor union is a means to fight for the interests of workers or laborers and creating harmonious industrial 
relations, dynamic and equitable. Therefore, laborers and labor unions must have a sense of responsibility for the survival of the 
company and vice versa enterpreneur treat workers or laborers as a partner in accordance with human dignity. 
 
Conflict management 
Besides as individual beings, humans are social beings Soekamto (1996: 24). Where they are not a dichotomous unrelated, but it 
is a point that is connected from a linear line. Under certain circumstances that point will be shifted from the individual to the 
creatures domain to the domain of social beings, because of the dynamics of an increasingly dynamic environment. Each 
individual with all the advantages and limitations inherent in it has a number of needs (primary, secondary and tertiary) that must 
be met, and something to be achieved within the present and future to maintain its existence. To realize the needs and desired 
goals, not seldom require assistance or cooperation with other individuals, forming groups. 
 
In the next several groups to form larger groups and is known by the term organization. Robbins (2004: 4) defines the 
organization as a whole (entity) which coordinated social conscious, with a relatively identifiable boundary, which works on the 
basis of relatively continuously to achieve a common goal or group of destinations. From this sense, the term social cohesion 
means that the unit is made up of people or groups of people who interact with one another. 
 
Regardless of whether the organization is informal and formal organization, the interaction between members of the group could 
not be avoided. When inside an organization have an interaction between the individuals exist, then the conflict is a thing that 
can not be avoided. Exactly what was said Lewis A. Coser (1972 : 43), that the conflict both between groups and intra-group 
there is always a place people live together. 
 
Conflict in Different Perspective 
In essence, there are two main views in view of the conflict, namely the traditional view and interactionist. In the traditional 
view, the conflict is identified with violence, destruction and irrationality that would interfere with cooperation to achieve 
organizational goals. Thus, in the thought of this concept, conflict always implies a negative, ugly and destructive. The 
responsibility of management is to prevent the conflict down to its roots. Instead, the interactionist view, the conflict would 
encourage the effectiveness of the organization in the form of change and making better decisions. Without conflict, an 
organization will be static, apathetic and unresponsive. However, in order to be functional, the conflict must be controlled 
intelligently and professionally, so that the effectiveness of the organization will be optimal. In view of this, does not mean that 
all conflicts are functional because there is also a conflict that have negative effects on the effectiveness of the organization. In 
such case, the management should try to reduce the conflict. 

Confederation of Labor 
Union 

Federation of Labor Union 

 
Labor Union 

Founded by at least 3 Federation of Labour Unions 

 

Founded by at least 5 Labor Unions  

Founded by at least 10 workers or laborers 
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Without forgetting the other factors causing the emergence of conflict, Robbins (2002) focuses on the sources of conflict that 
comes from the organizational structure. Among them, 1) the interdependence of work, 2) the dependence of work in one 
direction, 3) differentiation of horizontal high, 4) formalization low, 5) dependence on a shared source of rare, 6) differences in 
evaluation criteria and a system of rewards, 7) decision participative decision, 8) diversity of members, 9) mismatch status, 10) 
dissatisfaction roles, 11) the distortion of communication. 
 
While Daft (1998: 487) outlining wider than Robins (2002) by outlining the factors causing the conflict is not just a problem of 
structure, but include: 1) environment, 2) organization size, 3) technology, 4) goals and 5) structure. While Jones (2001 : 422) in 
the part of Pondy’s models identify five sources of conflict include 1) interdependence, 2) differnces in goals and priorites, 3) 
bureaucratic factors, 4) incompatible performace criteria and 5) competition for scarce resources. 
 
Conflict relationship with Organizational Effectiveness 
In certain circumstances the role of man as an individual being shifted into a social creature. Thus indirectly require a shift in the 
understanding of the conflict itself from the traditional view to interactionist. Due to the conflict will always exist where there is 
no interaction or coexistence. This led to the emergence of the view that the conflict could increase the effectiveness of the 
organization, to continue to control the conflict itself. 
 
Managers must try to maintain the conflict at its optimal level and type of functional conflict. So that would be obtained internal 
characteristics of an organization that is passionate, self-critical and innovative, and ultimately the effectiveness of the 
organization will be achieved. While if the conflict is at a high level, the type of conflict has led to the dysfunctional nature of the 
internal organization and lead to a split, which resulted in low effectiveness of the organization, managers must revolution 
conflict so back at an optimal level. But if the level of conflict is low, and the internal nature of organizations that tend apathetic, 
not responsive and effective organization also lower then stimulate the conflict is the right solution for managers. 
 
Conceptual Framework 
Frame of mind in this study based on the fact that the management of conflicts in industrial relations involvement of all 
stakeholders in the organization. Support regulations and policies are also strongly demanded that the conflict can be managed 
properly in order to achieve a favorable climate objectives so that employees can work optimally to the achievement of 
organizational goals. The parties involved are very diverse, ranging from the employees themselves, management, and 
government. Through organizations that remain under the parent organization to the companies, unions had a big influence. 
 
Based on the phenomenon that occurs in an organization, it is necessary to do a study that aims to map the factors specifically 
related to conflict management in particular industrial worker organization’s involvement in shaping the culture of the 
organization in conflict management. Today organizations of workers emerged as an organization that is the management 
judgment in this case the entrepreneur or company in determining policy. The role of workers organizations to be important in 
determining the direction of the company and as one of the staircases in achieving optimal performance of a company. 
Undeniably, labor organization as if it had fangs participate in determining the policies of the company. 
 
A culture in an organization that emerged from the individual culture into a factor that cannot be separated in this study. 
Organizational culture is formed by implanting habits or routines on all players in the organization. Similarly, the organizational 
culture and conflict management in a company. How to labor union organizations to take part in shaping the culture will be the 
focus of researchers in addition to conflict management. So it can be described in a framework in this study are as follows: 
 

Figure 2. Conseptual Framework 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   Source: Developed for this study 
 
Involvement of labor unions as a container other than the aspirations of employees in the framework of the submission of the 
opinion to the employers also play a role in shaping the culture of the organization is a reflection of the behavior of the 
organization or company. So the focus of this research is how the role of labor union organizations in the management of 
possible conflicts that arise in industrial relations between employees of Jasa Tirta I, the employer in this case the management 
company, the government and unions themselves. 
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As described in the previous chapter, Jasa Tirta I formed the labor union organization by setting up the Association of 
Employees of Jasa Tirta I (Ikajati) which is an organization (association) employees of Jasa Tirta I. Ikajati as one of the objects 
of research are expected to have a role in managing conflicts in the company by observing the behavior of actors in the 
organization which is a reflection of a culture of the organization. 
 
Research Design 
The design of this study refers to the model cycle Kemmis and M. Taggart (1998) with the following four steps: 1) preparation, 
2) the implementation phase, 3) the stage of monitoring (observation and monitoring), and 4) the stage of reflection. Then based 
on the analysis and reflection will be reformulated as a corrective action plan following that action research can achieve its 
original goals and objectives. 
 
In qualitative research, the researcher is a tool (instrument) primary data collectors, since investigators are human and only 
human beings who can relate to the respondent or any other object, and able to understand the link realities on the ground. 
Therefore, researchers also participate in an observation or participant observation. 
 
Analysis of data using content analisys. The data analysis performed in this study is the concept of data analysis developed by 
Miles and Huberman (1994) in K.D Norman (1997), which is an ongoing activity of the data collection, data reduction, display 
data, conclution and verification, conclution drawing. 
 
Data were collected from in-depth interviews and observation and then the results are recorded and copied in the form of a 
transcript. In this study, researchers conducted observations and preliminary interviews to determine more closely the issues to 
be studied more deeply. It is to be taken into consideration and further data gathering further input. Researchers have an interim 
analysis of the observations or preliminary observation, then do the recording field and recopied by classifying according to the 
characteristics of interviews and observations based on the relevance of the objectives to be achieved from this research. 
 
The data obtained in the field grouped according to the characteristics and their relevance to the purpose of this study. 
Researchers focus on things that are important to look for a theme grouping, making it easier for researchers in collecting further 
data. In addition to classifying the data, also analyzed in order to provide a clearer picture and focused on the goals of the 
research. 
 
Researchers categorize based on interviews that according to, support of organizations like the policy or rules are clear, 
communication, working conditions, transparency and fair treatment and safety at work. Then the researchers conducted a 
reduction back to things that are deemed necessary are grouped based on the description of such conditions occur, pressure, 
interventions, looking for secure, afraid of the boss and others. It is easier for researchers to make a final conclusion on the 
condition that actually happened. 
 
Data that has been reduced can be presented in narrative form, the relationship between categories, flowchart or the like, in the 
hope of easy to understand what is at issue completely and can direct future activities. The initial conclusion is based on 
observations and interviews preliminary temporary. This is useful for researchers step into the next stage of more in-depth. If in 
the process of further research no data was found to be changed or fixed it can be verified back. 
 
Results And Discussion 
Public Company, Jasa Tirta I is a State-Owned Enterprises (BUMN), which was established on February 12, 1990 with PP 5 of 
1990 which was changed several times, the last with PP 46 Year 2010 concerning Perum Jasa Tirta I. In the 1990s, at the 
beginning of the establishment, the employees of Perum Jasa Tirta I was civil servant (PNS) name under the Ministry of Public 
Works. When the government canalization of workers through the All Indonesian Workers Union (SPSI) and for PNS through 
the Corps of Employees Affairs of the Republic of Indonesia (KORPRI). The purpose of the canalization facilitates the 
government in control of the restrictions on the right of association and assembly on the two organizations that have ideology, 
doctrine and thinking that no government wants difficult to develop, it will perpetuate the hegemony and the doctrine of the ruler 
at the time. If divided into phases, labor unions Jasa Tirta I (Ikajati) experienced several phases in the course of his organization, 
which is as follows: 
 
Geriliya Phase 
In this phase, as part of state institutions, employees Jasa Tirta I when required or “forced” to join KORPRI, employee status 
result of new recruitment is no longer PNS but employees of companies who are appointed by the Decree of the Board of 
Directors with funding payroll purely from the company (not of the government budget). Extraordinary discrimination between 
employees with the status of civil servants and non-civil servants, not only at work but also after retirement is still discrimination 
social security for them. Reform in 1998 to tap into canalization dissolve the association and implemented by the government. 
Unions stood at almost all companies in Indonesia, including in the state including the Jasa Tirta I. 
 
Birth of Embryo Unions Phase 
Officials began to retire, including officials who are known repressive in response to the establishment of labor unions in Jasa 
Tirta I, these circumstances serve as the starting point back in a big step to realize the ideals set up labor unions. Beginning in 
2000 initiated to establish Ikajati. Space discussions held from house to house is not in the office. Some employees with PNS 
also participated in the founding of the union because empathize with discrimination. Grouping shifted, in this phase of the 
conflict is no longer centered on the support and do not support of the union, but rather a group represented by young and old 
group. 
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Organizational Growth Phase 
In this phase, Ikajati still choose to avoid direct confrontation with the management, so that in this phase of the struggle Ikajati 
activity tends to be less visible. Various parsed and discuss employment issues is limited by the management board, the board 
can freely in and out of the working space of Directors to discuss a problem, so the board members assess the capacity to defend 
its own interests rather than to improve the welfare of employees at large. 
 
Inactivity Organization Phase 
In the period 2007 - 2010 is at a inactivity point of Ikajati, administrators have started serving structurally be one reason Ikajati 
be inactive. At this time the organization is run by a potluck, there is no clear work program and agenda of the organization that 
will be implemented. The addition of administrators in positions of responsibility inherent structural reasons inactivity of the 
organization. 
 
The number of members reached 75% of total employees turned out to anesthetize organization. Succession were supposed to be 
held in 2008 passed and the new was held in 2010, so many outstanding issues that Ikajati successfully “bought” by the 
management company. The issue was denied necessarily the truth by the board. Inactivity occurs for two reasons, first because of 
the saturation of the organization and secondly because of the rush of management, so that agendas have been prepared only on 
paper never realized. Although in inactivity phase, the board managed to communicate a variety of proposals to change the logic 
of the PKB is agreed upon. 
 
Affirmation as Unions Phase 
In this phase Ikajati declared itself a Unions. At Member Meeting in 2010 was thrown discourse changed the name of the 
Association of Employees PJT I became Unions PJT I, the proposal raises the pros and cons, but senior figures Ikajati expressed 
the view that should the name Ikajati retained because it contains a long history, while for confirmation Ikajati position as the 
union can be listed after writing the name Ikajati. In this phase of the conflict in PJT I seemed to return in two groups of young 
and old. Chairman Ikajati elected representation of young leaders, aged 26 years old at that time with tenure at PJT I in 3 years. 
Activities change frontal organization, management more straight forward in delivering the aspirations and tend to open direct 
confrontation with management that is dominated by the old group. 
 
In this phase a lot of new things achieved, especially in improving the welfare of members and their families listed in PKB, 
including eliminating the employee status of permanent employee and non-permanent employee, increased earnings significantly 
housed within PKB, improvement of health services (class upgrade hospitalization), eliminating discriminatory health services 
for permanent and non-permanent employee clerks, medical check-up families, engage all employees on mandatory social 
security program, severance calculations accretion factor of 2.5 times the THP and others. 
 

Figure 3. Organizational Structure of Ikajati 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Crisis Regeneration Phase 
This phase is the final phase in the course of the organization up to this time. Stewardship previously dominated by young people 
makes the regeneration of unplanned and running optimally. Regeneration is not planned to have an impact on the sustainability 
of the organization, one sign of decline in the quality management of the organization is the predominance by the person or 
group, specific to the organization. 
 
In Ikajati 4th Congress which took place in 2013 ago to produce stewardship “fresh”, caretaker of mostly new employees 
(average life of 2-3 years) and had no previous organizational experience led to regeneration efforts hampered. Awareness of 
new board for successful regeneration program complements threat to regeneration, in addition to regeneration program that is 
not clear arranged. 
 
Analysis of Conflict in Perum Jasa Tirta I (PJT I) 
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State-Owned Enterprises (BUMN) have the same rights related to the rights of workers to organize. Likewise, the Public 
Corporation (Perum) Jasa Tirta I is a state duty, among others, exploitation and maintenance of water infrastructure in Indonesia. 
PJT I was established on February 12, 1990 based on Government Regulation No. 5 of 1990 on PJT I which subsequently 
amended several times, most recently by Government Regulation, PP No. 46 Year 2010 concerning PJT I is an entity quasi 
business owned by the Government in order to carry out some tasks of the Government in the field of water resources 
management that includes operation and maintenance of water resources infrastructure, optimization of state assets that are part 
of the water resources infrastructure as well as the exploitation of water resources to support government programs in the field of 
water security, food security and the stability of the national economy. 
 
The establishment of PJT I will be based on the needs of institutions managing water resources infrastructure that has been built 
by the government. Brantas project is the establishment of PJT I. Spirit possessed by Brantas Project is the spirit of building and 
dedicating themselves to the realization of large dams in the valley of Brantas. Brantas Project field technical implementation 
unit under the Ministry of Public Works, the activities carried out is to do the construction of several large dams, flood gates and 
some other water resources along the Brantas river. Sources of funds used for development is quite clear that the state budget and 
foreign loans, so the focus Brantas Project workers when it is carrying out the construction in accordance with planning with 
quality and good quality. 
 
As the company grew with the approach of the bureaucracy, PJT I face the challenge of transformation, the transformation of the 
bureaucracy to the corporate culture. PJT I employee must abandon the habit of Brantas Project is always secure their funding 
sources. As a company, PJT I required to make approaches corporative improve services for water resources management and 
production in the field of water resources for profit used to finance the company’s operations including labor costs, operation and 
maintenance of water resources infrastructure and provide benefits to the state as the owner of capital in the form of dividends. 
Such challenges can be faced without their necessarily productive synergy between management and the workers themselves. 
Conflict management is also the basis of success or failure in such synergies. Based on the analysis during the study period, the 
labor conflict in PJT I can be divided into two (2), namely: conflict due to disputes over rights and conflicts of interest that arise 
both between the worker with the company management. 
 
Conflicts occur due to disputes over rights normally associated with the implementation of the agreements stipulated in the 
Collective Labour Agreement (PKB) as well as legislation and into employees basic rights but not implemented by the 
management. Conflict of interest is a conflict due to disputes arising from oral and written promises given by the management to 
the workers for a policy that benefits workers but not realized. In this conflict it is also possible the delivery of those promises in 
writing through the Plan Activities and Company Budget (RKAP). Besides conflicts of interest could potentially arise if the 
company’s operation found inequities in the provision of reward and punishment which tends to favor a particular position 
group, causing jealousy for another position group. The triggering factors of conflict, including: 
1. The Board of Directors policies that conflict with PKB or legislation. 
2. The implementation of reward and punishment is not fair. 
3. Gaps welfare. 
4. The application of employment provisions inconsistent (payroll, career and rank, etc.). 
5. The pattern of leadership and the lack of proper communication. 
6. The parties have a different understanding of the suatau problems, etc. 
 
Conclusions And Recommendations 
Based on the research that has been done can be summarized as follows: 
1. The role of labor union organizations to be very important in determining management policies. The union becomes a 

container in delivering the aspirations of employees that are part contribution to the company’s employees. 
2. The organization of labor unions to manage conflict well is expected to be part of the motor of the company’s progress. 

Proven in some respects in accordance with the results of the research, the union was able to resolve conflicts without 
weakening partly conflicting parties. 

3. In running the organization, cultivate union members to work together and form solidarity among its members. Behaviors 
and habits that is expected to shape the culture of the organization mature and become a strong foundation for the progress 
of the company. 

4. Not all employees can adjust themselves to the development of the organization, every learning organization is constantly 
facing various problems, especially is a rejection of change. The rejection of change is not always show up in the standard 
form (explicit) and immediately filed a protest, for example, threatened strikes, demonstrations and the like but also a 
rejection of explicit and gradually decreases as loyalty to the organization, reduced motivation. Culture or habits have 
implications for speed and accuracy in the completion of the work. A healthy organizational culture affect the increased 
effectiveness. 

 
The study was conducted with qualitative methods and using primary data obtained through interviews. Limitations in the study 
include subjectivity is on the researcher. This research is very dependent on the interpretation of the researcher on the implied 
meaning in the interview so the tendency to refraction still exists. To reduce refraction then do a process of triangulation of 
sources and methods. Triangulation is done by cross-checking the data with facts from different informants and from other 
research. While triangulation method is done by using several methods in data collection, namely in-depth interviews and 
observation. 
Union organization should always try to learn how to manage social conflict through behaviour modification. Based on existing 
theory, that the ethical and humanist approach requires changes that are key to the transformation in the behavior of the group. 
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Through theory, group dynamics, the study, which are all mutually inclusive process and if managed properly, collectively could 
bring effective change. 
 
Ikajati must be an organization that always learn if you want to survive as an organization forward. How then Ikajati successfully 
manage change? The first should prepare by creating a team that psychologically and physically will be involved in creating 
meaningful and productive change. Secondly, it is necessary to apply the design to the ideology that change is underway, so 
Ikajati must convert to a more open design. Officers and members are able to provide the pilot involved in the process 
transparent and participatory schemes that simultaneously collect feedback. Group or union organizations must remain flexible 
and expect readjustment necessary to achieve sustainable solutions and discuss common interests of both parties collectively. To 
achieve the proposed changes, the use of a neutral third party (facilitator and / or mediator) professionals will be required to 
manage change for the sake of progress. 
 
This research still has a scope that is not too wide, so the need for additional criteria for observation in subsequent studies. 
Researchers simply linking the role of labor union organizations to conflict management and organizational culture. Future 
research on the structure of the union should focus on the effects of competing theories such as: leadership bounded rationality, 
ambiguity causal agency theory, the effects of this type of behavior / characteristics, factors of emotional intelligence, conflict 
theory, and the effects of leadership styles. Subsequent research could also investigate how all the concepts are different and 
theories that affect the combined effect of synergy in a way that fosters constructive conflict and destructive conflict events 
minimized. 
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